

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
Selena Schmidt, Executive Director/CEO
7210 Virginia Pkwy #6116
P.O. Box 6116
McKinney, TX 75071

Invoice 249639
July 24, 2019

ID: 15653-0002000 - AFR

Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY
SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

Email: Selena Schmidt (sschmidt@muttsandmayhem.org)

For Services Rendered Through July 22, 2019

Current Fees	22,227.50	
Current Disbursements	136.15	
Courtesy Discount	-6,000.00	
Total Current Charges		16,363.65
Total Due		16,363.65

TO INSURE PROPER CREDIT, PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Payments received after the date of this statement or payments applicable to other matters are not reflected. This statement may not include disbursements and other charges incurred but not yet posted to our accounting records.

This statement is payable in Fort Worth, Tarrant County, Texas.

100 Main Street, Fort Worth, Texas 76102-3090

www.belaw.com

Tax I.D. No. 75-1792022

Telephone Number: 817-338-1700

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 2

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Fees				
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
05/23/19	KCS	Conference call with Office of the Attorney General, Ms. Challa, to discuss the attorney general's potential involvement in this case.	0.80	172.00
05/24/19	KCS	Conference call with Selena Schmidt to discuss issue related to criminal complaint along with status of case; Research related to criminal complaint issue, specifically violation of fiduciary-held money prior to cessation of research due to outside of scope of representation as confirmed in conference call; Research specific to whether attorney's fees available for voluntary dismissal of TTLA claim by Plaintiff in fourth amended complaint. (No Charge)	1.00	0.00
05/27/19	KCS	Research specific to Texas Health and Safety Code related to animal welfare organizations in preparation for amended answer and potential counterclaims; Research specific to Animal Welfare Act and the applicable code of federal regulations in preparation for amended answer and potential counterclaims.	2.00	430.00
05/29/19	AFR	Meeting with S. Schmidt regarding history of litigation, litigation strategy and analysis.	2.50	937.50
05/29/19	KCS	Conference with clients and A. Robbins regarding case, evidence, and strategy moving forward through trial; Begin file review including discovery requests, responses, and production of documents; Begin research specific to motion for protective order.	2.00	430.00
06/03/19	RMR	Begin reviewing and analyzing the case file (pleadings, discovery, correspondence, affidavits, client docs, agreements and file notes).	2.80	0.00
06/04/19	RMR	Continue review and analysis the case file (pleadings, discovery, correspondence, affidavits, client docs, agreements and file notes); draft correspondence re: findings and recommendations.	4.80	0.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 3

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/04/19	KCS	Research specific to filing motion for protective order; Research specific to defendant as prevailing party when nonsuit without prejudice in preparation for motion for attorney's fees under the Texas Theft Liability Act.	3.60	774.00
06/05/19	RMR	Multiple phone conferences and email exchanges with L. Solis re: the Affidavits of V. Rollo, S. Rollo & S. Schmidt, the motion for summary judgment filings and issues related to same; Phone conference with S. Schmidt re: the Rollo affidavits, attorneys' fees, documents missing from the case file and May 13, 2019 correspondence from the Attorney General; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt to B. McClelland and M. Doyle re: the Rollo Affidavits; Exchange correspondence with M. Hocutt re: the May 13, 2019 letter from the Attorney General Review the Court's docket and draft correspondence to the Clerk re: document No. 194; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: questions about the case file; Follow-up phone conference with S. Schmidt re: attorneys' fees, pro se correspondence and email from B. McClelland's office; Receive and review correspondence from L. Solis re: the Rollo Affidavits and threatening to bill us unless we halt all communications; Receive and review the Dropbox link from S. Schmidt and compare the same to the originally received file and review the discrepancies; Complete review and analysis the case file (pleadings, discovery, correspondence, affidavits, client docs, agreements and file notes); Draft correspondence re: findings and recommendations.	7.00	1,190.00
06/05/19	KCS	Research regarding motion for protective order; Review client documentation received from opposing counsel; Review and timeline dispositive motions, exhibits attached, and other pleadings for case strategy and potential motions for fees or sanctions.	1.20	258.00
06/05/19	AFR	Telephone conference with prior counsel regarding Rollo's	0.10	37.50

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 4

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		affidavits and status of case when he withdrew.		
06/06/19	RMR	Review and analyze the correspondence file received from S. Schmidt (352 files plus attachments).	6.00	1,020.00
06/06/19	KCS	Receive and review e-mail correspondence from client, including correspondence with prior counsel, opposing counsel, and evidence in support of client's claims and defenses.	4.70	1,010.50
06/06/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: email communications; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: S. Shuster's knowledge of relevant facts; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt and the website file index re: the Rollos' affidavits; Receive and review correspondence and backup from S. Schmidt re: R. Turner handling the case for STS pro bono, along with the Twisted Tails and followers' Facebook posts and videos of Hachi's capture; Receive and review the legal invoices, fund report and correspondence from S. Schmidt re: same; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: initial correspondence with V. Rollo.	1.10	187.00
06/07/19	AFR	Work on motion for protective order.	0.40	150.00
06/07/19	KCS	Finalize review and timeline of client documentation and evidence; Research specific to motions for protective order and for sanctions in light of evidence in client's file related to opposing counsel conduct; Research specific to grounds for protection after pro se defendant agrees to deposition outside of scheduling order in light of continuance granted for time to secure new counsel; Draft motion for protective order and compile exhibits.	3.50	752.50
06/07/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: notice from the Court re: service on unrepresented parties.	0.10	17.00
06/09/19	KCS	Review, revise, and finalize motion for protective order and exhibits.	0.50	107.50

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 5

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/10/19	RMR	Review and revise the Affidavit to the motion for protective order; Prepare exhibits for the motion for protective order; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: her Affidavit; Draft correspondence to Plaintiff's counsel re: Defendants' are reserving the right to use all documents produced by Plaintiff during pre-trial proceedings or trial; Phone conference with the Court Clerk re: pro se service issue.	1.30	221.00
06/10/19	KCS	Finalize motion for protective order, including changes based on client's review and notice of appearance for filing.	1.00	215.00
06/10/19	AFR	Lengthy conference with S. Schmidt regarding settlement "offer" by plaintiff and terms by which they could reach agreement, plaintiff's answers to interrogatories claiming they never "captured" the dog and overall strategy.	0.30	112.50
06/10/19	RMR	Review and make additional revisions to the Motion for Protective Order; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: operations, funds depletion and name change for Mutts & Mayhem; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: pro se service issue.	0.30	51.00
06/11/19	AFR	Multiple telephone conferences with R. Turner regarding possible resolution of case and exchange emails to S. Schmidt re: same; Revise motion to quash (n/c); Finalize supplemental responses to discovery; Review and locate counsel fee bills for supplementation of request for production - direct R. Rogers to bates label documents.	1.50	562.50
06/11/19	RMR	Review and revise Defendants' Joint Motions to Quash Notice of Deposition and 4th Request for Production. Draft correspondence to R. Turner re: Mutts & Mayhem's supplement to discovery responses with documents Bates labeled MUTTS0124 through MUTTS0148; Receive and review correspondence from R. Turner re: the deposition of S. Schmidt; Phone conference with T. Schwartz re: the pre-trial conference;	1.30	221.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 6

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		Receive and review S. Schmidt's completed Affidavit for the Motion for Protective Order; Exchange correspondence with S. Schmidt's re: her Affidavit to be attached as an exhibit to the Motion for Protective Order.		
06/12/19	AFR	Receive and review email notification from court regarding filing and acceptance of Defendants' Joint Motions to Quash Notice of Deposition and Fourth Request for Production; Receive information from court on conflict in docket control hearing.	0.20	75.00
06/12/19	RMR	Exchange multiple correspondence with T. Schwartz re: the pre-trial conference; Draft correspondence to R. Turner re: the pre-trial conference; Receive and review correspondence from R. Turner re: conversation with the Court Coordinator; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: contacts at animal control; Update the persons with knowledge list to reflect the Rollos' contact information; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: Mr. & Mrs. Rollo.	0.80	136.00
06/13/19	RMR	Exchange multiple correspondence with S. Schmidt re: persons with knowledge list; Receive and review StreetstoSheets' Supplemental Responses to Request for Disclosure and the related document production; Receive and review follow-up correspondence from R. Turner re: Plaintiff's Amended Responses to Requests for Disclosure and enclosing additional document production.	0.70	119.00
06/13/19	AFR	Telephone call with E. Wood regarding motion to compel attorneys' fees under TTLA and receive briefing on same. (No Charge)	0.40	0.00
06/16/19	RMR	Receive and review multiple correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the Allen Animal Control Officer Mutts & Mayhem partners with and other persons with knowledge; Receive and review personal disclosures from S. Schmidt.	0.20	34.00
06/17/19	RMR	Draft Defendants' Certificate of Written Discovery; Review and	1.20	204.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 7

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		revise Defendants' Supplemental Response to Plaintiff's Request for Disclosure and Persons with Knowledge list and prepare document production, Bates labeled MUTTS0148 thru MUTTS0154; Receive and review Mutts & Mayhem's Certificate of Formation and Articles of Incorporation.		
06/17/19	AFR	Finalize supplemental response to plaintiff's request for disclosure; Receive and review email notification from court regarding filing and acceptance of defendants' certificate of written discovery; Receive and brief review of corporate in-take bylaws.	0.40	150.00
06/18/19	RMR	Prepare A. Robbins's trial notebook. (No Charge)	2.40	0.00
06/18/19	AFR	Telephone conference with V. Rollo regarding persons with knowledge of relevant facts; Work on Motion for attorneys' fees under TTLA.	2.10	787.50
06/19/19	RMR	Draft A. Robbins's vacation designation; Receive and review StreetstoSheets' Facebook post re: they did not capture Hobo and correspondence from S. Schmidt re: same.	0.30	51.00
06/19/19	AFR	Receive and review email notification from Court regarding filing and acceptance of notice of unavailability for April Robbins; Analyze elements of plaintiff's claims against M&M necessary for trial strategy and witness preparation; Draft spoliation instruction pleadings and work on plea for attorneys' fees for TTLA claim.	4.90	1,837.50
06/21/19	RMR	Draft the Second Amended Exhibit A - Persons with Knowledge list and prepare document production, Bates labeled MUTTS0155 thru MUTTS0159; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: Mutts & Mayhem's formation documents; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: Mutts & Mayhem's formation documents.	0.40	68.00
06/21/19	AFR	Lengthy telephone conference regarding former volunteer with STS who will provide testimony for M&M, discovery motion and	3.50	1,312.50

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 8

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/21/19	RMR	spoliation motion and work on discovery supplementation; Lengthy telephone conference with K. Cessna regarding her efforts to capture BooBoo/Hobo/Hachi and problems with STS; Continue working on witnesses for trial and identification of their testimony; Begin receiving Facebook posts and messages from K. Cessna regarding her efforts on behalf of Hachi.	0.70	119.00
06/24/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: G. Jackson's Facebook post; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: the persons with knowledge list additions; Receive and review the email chain between K. Cessna & S. Schmidt and correspondence from Schmidt re: same; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: additions to the persons with knowledge list ; Review and revise the persons with knowledge list.	1.80	306.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 9

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		knowledge list; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: G. Jackson's contact information; Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the trial subpoena list; Receive and review second correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the trial subpoena list; Review and analyze S. Schmidt's thorough July 11, 2018 statement and timeline and correspondence from Schmidt re: same; Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: information needed for P. Segovia.		
06/24/19	AFR	Work on drafting chronology, drafting elements memorandum of facts to be proven at trial, witness information to determine who should be subpoenaed for trial and overall strategy.	7.50	2,812.50
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to Counsel re: the pre-trial conference.	0.20	34.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to the Court Coordinator re: correspondence transmitted to counsel re: the pre-trial conference.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from T. Schwartz re: the pre-trial conference.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to T. Schwartz re: the pre-trial conference.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: the pre-trial conference.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review second correspondence from S. Schmidt re: J. Blackburn's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: K. Harris' specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: P. Segovia's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and email exchanges with Segovia and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: M.	0.10	17.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 10

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
		Boehler's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.		
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: J. Blackburn's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: additional information as to T. Kraemer's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: R. Castillo's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review second correspondence from S. Schmidt re: R. Castillo's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review Facebook posts and correspondence from S. Schmidt re: N. Sheldon's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.20	34.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review Facebook posts and correspondence from S. Schmidt re: R. Gagnon's specific knowledge related to this lawsuit and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.20	34.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the trial subpoenas.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review second correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the trial subpoenas.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: the revised persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt inquiring about her Facebook response to N. Sheldon.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Phone conference with S. Schmidt re: the persons with knowledge list, evidence and status of pending motions.	0.40	68.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 11

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Tammy Dupal.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Bonnie Agee.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Reyna Castillo.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Karolyn Cessna.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Guila Jackson.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Valerie Rollo.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Stephanie Shuster.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft a trial subpoena for Mysti Boehler.	0.30	51.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: the 2nd fundraiser that STS was hosting on behalf of M&M & M. Boehler's Facebook post re: M&M didn't "put boots on the ground."	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: new evidence found of STS asking for long-term rescue.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: Reyna Castillo's trial subpoena.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: Anneke Tamminga-Jones' Facebook posts and possible candidate as a person with knowledge.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: her communications with N. Sheldon.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to S. Schmidt re: the fundraiser for M&M hosted by STS.	0.10	17.00
06/25/19	AFR	Continue working on persons with knowledge list, trial witness information and strategy.	4.80	1,800.00
06/25/19	AFR	Receive confirmation email from court of rescheduled pretrial conference.	0.10	37.50
06/26/19	AFR	Telephone conference with J. Washburn regarding M. Boehler and testifying.	0.20	75.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 12

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review additional information provided by S. Schmidt as to Dr. Rayner's involvement and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review additional information on J. Buron-Washburn from S. Schmidt and the Facebook posts involving Buron-Washburn.	0.30	51.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review STS' Facebook post (6/16/2018) where the video was originally posted along with photos and correspondence from S. Schmidt re: same.	0.20	34.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review second email from S. Schmidt re: L. Forbes and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review second correspondence from S. Schmidt re: R. Castillo's information; update the persons with knowledge list and subpoena for Castillo.	0.20	34.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: R. Castillo's information and the related article re: Castillo and her husband.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: K. Matthews' Affidavit and name.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: L. Forbes and update the persons with knowledge list.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review third email from S. Schmidt re: L. Forbes, along with Forbes' Facebook and rescue profile pages.	0.30	51.00
06/26/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: A. Tamminga-Jones' knowledge.	0.10	17.00
06/26/19	AFR	Email exchange with S. Schmidt regarding persons with most knowledge to add to amended list, descriptions of the knowledge and locations of individuals with knowledge.	0.20	75.00
06/26/19	AFR	Email exchange with opposing counsel regarding Plaintiffs' First Set of Interrogatories propounded to the Snyders.	0.10	37.50

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 13

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/27/19	RMR	Receive and review correspondence from S. Schmidt re: S. Mirikitani's involvement and correspondence from Mirikitani's correspondence to M&M; update the persons with knowledge list.	0.20	34.00
06/28/19	RMR	Obtain and review M. Boehler's background report.	0.30	51.00
07/01/19	RMR	Review and revise Defendants' Second Amended Exhibit A - Persons with Knowledge List.	0.30	51.00
07/01/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to R. Turner re: Defendants' Second Amended Exhibit A - Persons with Knowledge List.	0.30	51.00
07/01/19	RMR	Review and revise the Motion for Adverse Instruction on - Spoliation of Evidence.	0.30	51.00
07/02/19	RMR	Review and compare the evidence provided by S. Schmidt with the documents previously produced in this matter and prepare supplemental production, Bates labeled MUTTS0160 through MUTTS0264.	2.80	476.00
07/02/19	RMR	Draft correspondence to R. Turner re: Defendants' supplemental production.	0.30	51.00
07/02/19	RMR	Draft the Certificate of Written Discovery for Defendants' supplemental production.	0.30	51.00
07/03/19	RMR	Draft the Amended Motion for Adverse Instruction on - Spoliation of Evidence.	0.20	34.00
07/08/19	AFR	Email exchange with opposing counsel regarding withdraw of notice of deposition of Selena Schmidt and hearing on motion to quash.	0.10	37.50
07/09/19	KCS	Review, revise, and finalize motion for attorney's fees related to TTLA dismissal without prejudice.	1.50	322.50
07/10/19	AFR	Lengthy telephone conference with S. Schmidt regarding trial subpoenas, length of trial, evidence admissibility problems, jury issues and terms under which mutual release would be acceptable.	0.80	300.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
 I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
 Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
 EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

July 24, 2019
 Invoice 249639
 Page 14

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
 Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
 Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
07/11/19	AFR	Lengthy telephone conference with S. Schmidt regarding trial, strategy for trial, evidence hurdles, costs of prosecution of claims, benefits to MMESR, and what would constitute a victory; Telephone conference with R. Turner re: same.	1.00	375.00
07/12/19	AFR	Receive and review plaintiff's notice of non-suit.	0.10	37.50
07/12/19	AFR	Lengthy telephone conference with R. Turner to explain how MMESR would not sign any settlement or nondisclosure agreement but would agree to nonsuit if plaintiff would nonsuit and receive return call that plaintiff's had agreed.	0.50	187.50
Total Fees			98.90	22,227.50

Disbursement Summary

Description	Amount
Copying Expense	0.40
Filing Fees	18.54
Online Research	105.71
Color Copying Expense	11.50
Total Disbursements	
	136.15

Fee Recap

		Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
April F. Robbins	Partner	0.40	0.00	0.00
April F. Robbins	Partner	31.30	375.00	11,737.50
Kevin C. Smith	Associate	1.00	0.00	0.00
Kevin C. Smith	Associate	20.80	215.00	4,472.00
Randee M. Rogers	Paralegal	10.00	0.00	0.00
Randee M. Rogers	Paralegal	35.40	170.00	6,018.00

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.
I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR
Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT
Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue
Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.
Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

July 24, 2019
Invoice 249639
Page 15

	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
Totals	98.90		22,227.50

BRACKETT & ELLIS, P.C.
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS

MUTTS & MAYHEM EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE, INC.

I.D. 15653-0002000 - AFR

Re: STREETS TO SHEETS ANIMAL RESCUE V. MUTTS & MAYHEM
EMERGENCY SEARCH AND RESCUE & SELENA SCHMIDT

Claimant: Streets to Sheets Aminimal Rescue

Insured: Mutts & Mayhem Emergency Search and Rescue, Inc.

Cause No.: 18-C-3491 Ellis County

July 24, 2019

Invoice 249639

Page 16

Total Fees and Disbursements	22,363.65
Courtesy Discount	-6,000.00
Total Current Charges	16,363.65

Payments received after the date of this statement or payments applicable to other matters are not reflected. This statement may not include disbursements and other charges incurred but not yet posted to our accounting records.

This statement is payable in Fort Worth, Tarrant County, Texas.